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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, February 21, 2020 9:15 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 410 Virginia Street assessment questions

 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2019 4:36 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: 410 Virginia Street assessment questions 
 
Hi Lee, 
 
As this is a 4 plex and included in the program advanced should not be serving this property.  Republic is supposed to be 
providing billing and service as this is their area.  Please have the rear load dumpster removed from the property and 
cancel this account for Q4 2019. 
 
Thanks 
Chris    
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2019 8:51 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 410 Virginia Street assessment questions 
 
Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Chris, 
Please see update below from Lee. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Lenora Johnson <lenora.johnson@advanceddisposal.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2019 7:41 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: 410 Virginia Street assessment questions 
 
Sorry about the delay, 
 
This address has had a rear load container on site since 2016. Our office manager email the customer his account 
information on 10/4/2019. 
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Please let me know if you need anything else. 
 
Thank you 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2019 1:10 PM 
To: Lenora Johnson <lenora.johnson@advanceddisposal.com> 
Subject: FW: 410 Virginia Street assessment questions 
 
Lee, 
Please see request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2019 12:23 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 410 Virginia Street assessment questions 
 
Hi Greg, 
 
Have ADS been able to follow up on this?  ADS was billing and servicing this 4 unit even though Republic was supposed 
to be providing billing and service as this is their area. 
 
It seems unfair for the resident to be paying ADS (a consortium member) for service that should be provided by another 
consortium member. 
 
We had a public hearing yesterday on this issue and Council wants more information. 
 
Thanks  
 
Chris  
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Monday, November 4, 2019 1:11 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 410 Virginia Street assessment questions 
 
Hi Greg, 
 
Tetra Constantino 
410 Virginia Street 
651-210-0599 
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Can you send this to ADS to investigate?  Resident owns a 4 plex in St Paul.  Should be services under the citywide 
contract. He has 4 city carts at the property.   Republic is the provider in this area.  He also has am Advanced disposal 
dumpster at the property and has been paying for service this entire time.  You can see the payment history in the 
attached document.   
 
Has ADS been servicing this dumpster and 4 plex?  They should not be as this is not their service area.   
 
Secondly, we need to have ADS pull the dumpster so the resident starts to use the 4 bins that they have at the 
property.  Can you have the dumpster removal scheduled? 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

 


