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Mai Vang - Fwd: Property Taxes
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From:  oscar herrera <oscarh2013@gmail.com>
To: <mai.vang(@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Date: 3/4/2012 11:31 PM

Subject: Fwd: Property Taxes

---------- Forwarded message ~---------

From: Samayoa, Joyce <Joyce.Samayoa(@co.ramsey.mn.us>
Date: Wed, Feb 15,2012 at 2:25 PM

Subject: Property Taxes

To: OscarH2013(@gmail.com

Oscar:
Re: 29.29.22.34.0107
747 Edgerton St., St Paul, MN

Once the first payment plan is cancelled about mid March, 2012,

the State of MN does allow us to offer a 279 payment plan in which the
2011 taxes may also be included.

Thank you,

Joyce Samayoa

Ramsey County

Property Records and Revenue

90 Plato Blvd W

PO BOX 64097

St Paul MN 55164-0097

WebSite: www.co.ramsey.mn.us/prr

(651) 266-2002
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