
From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)
To: BF4 FutureBright
Cc: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council
Subject: RE: 101 Wheelock Parkway West - Saint Paul City Council Public Hearing Notice
Date: Monday, November 9, 2020 5:56:27 PM
Attachments: 101 Wheelock Pkwy W.pdf
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Good Evening,
 

Yes, you can still make a payment until November 15th.  I have attached a screen shot from our
website.  This will show you our address to mail in a payment.  You can also pay online at
www.stpaul.gov/assessments.
 
Please let me know if you have any other questions.
 
Thank you,
Lynn

 

From: BF4 FutureBright <wahkrimu@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 11:58 AM
To: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 101 Wheelock Parkway West - Saint Paul City Council Public Hearing Notice
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

 
Lynn, 
 
This is Lay Doh. Last time, I send you email about a notice on street maintenance service
program that say I haven't paid the fee for lighting and sweeping and You also said that you
didn't see the payment has been applied so I wonder can I still pay the full amount again? If
so, how can I do that? It would be greatly appreciated if you could get back to me.
Thank You 
Lay Doh 
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Make Payment Online


Property Address: 101 WHEELOCK PKWY W Select a different property


Property ID: 19-29-22-22-0018 


To get balance due for LEVIED assessments, enter the date when Real Estate would receive your payment 
(amounts may include interest). Select the assessments you want to pay by checking the box. If you want to make 
a partial payment, check the box and enter the amount to the right of the checked box. 


Our response to COVID-19: 


Due to our concern over the health and safety of our customers and staff from the spread of COVID-
19, we strongly encourage you to submit payments online (free when using your checking account) 
or mail your payment to the address below. We are not accepting payments in person at this time.


This is not your eCheck payment date. It is only for calculating interest. 


Note: Payments may not be processed after November 15, 2020 because the City must prepare the annual 
certification of assessments to property taxes. Payments received after that date will be returned.


Levied Assessments (due and payable) 


Assessment 
Number


Improvement
Interest 


Rate
Levied 
Date


Term 
Years


Levied 
Amount


Balance 
Due


Select to Pay
Partial Payment 


Accepted


165201 
Paving & Lighting Wheelock-Rice to 
Edgerton, Phase 1, Part A


3.23% 10/26/2016 20 $6,550.00 $5,240.00


176003 
Sanitary Sewer Connection in ROW - 
Wheelock Pkwy, Ph I Pt A


4.15% 4/5/2017 20 $2,192.40 $1,863.54


200080 2020 SSSC / Storm Sewer 3.25% 8/25/2020 1 $101.38 $101.38


Levied Balance Due: $7,204.92 $0.00 


Fees and Pending Assessments (Payments are accepted) 


Project 
Number


Improvement
Pending 


Date
Term 
Years


Pending 
Amount


Select to Pay
Partial Payment 


Accepted


2020SMSP 2020 SMSP / Sweeping and Lighting 8/21/2020 1 $83.00


Pending Balance Due: $83.00 $0.00 


Levied and Pending Balance (as of the date above): $7,287.92


Amount I want to pay (as of the date above): $0.00


Make Payment via U.S. Mail


City of Saint Paul
Assessments 


2020-11-09


$0.00


$0.00


$0.00


$0.00
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eCheck Payment


Processed using your savings/checking account.
There is no charge for paying by eCheck.


Credit/Debit Card Payment


Bank collected card fee of 2.49% will be added to the 
transaction.


Payment will be processed immediately and cannot be 
scheduled for a later date. Payments processed after 8:00 pm 


will be posted the following business day. 


Payments will be made using US Bank secure website. 


CITY OF ST PAUL - ASSESSMENTS
700 CITY HALL


15 WEST KELLOGG BOULEVARD
ST PAUL, MN 55102-1658 


Questions? Call Assessments 
at (651) 266-8858 


Assessments Certified to Property Taxes
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Lynn M. Rolf
 Assessments Supervisor

Office of Financial Services/Real Estate
700 City Hall. 15 West Kellogg Boulevard
int Paul. MN 55102

266-8851

The Mose iabie
Gy in America

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America





On Oct 30, 2020, at 1:14 PM, Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:
 
Lay,

Would you mind sending me a copy of the front and back of your check?  I don't see
that a payment has been applied and would like to confirm that we did cash the check
and that it was applied to the correct property.

Thank you,
Lynn

-----Original Message-----
From: BF4 FutureBright <wahkrimu@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 11:39 AM
To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Saint Paul City Council Public Hearing Notice

Hello,
This is Lay Doh and I just received a notice on the street maintenance service program
that say we haven’t paid the fee for lighting and sweeping which is 83.00 dollars, but I
remember I did send you. The check includes the cost of the storm sewer system,
which is $101.38. If you guys haven’t received the checks, can you let me know?  How
can I pay the full amount again if you haven’t received? Thanks you

Owner:
Lay Doh and Lah Say Htoo
Property Address:
101 Wheelock Pkwy W
Saint Paul MN 55117
Property ID Number:
19-29-22-22-0018

Sincerely,
Lay Doh 
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