Mai Vang

From: Amanda Bugge <amanda.bugge@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2024 10:59 AM

To: Mai Vang

Subject: Re: 935 Woodbridge Street

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

612.232.1745

Thank you!

From: Mai Vang <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2024 6:33 AM

To: Amanda Bugge <amanda.bugge@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: 935 Woodbridge Street

Can you provide a phone number in case.

From: Amanda Bugge <amanda.bugge@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 4:01 PM

To: Mai Vang <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: steve bugge <stevenbugge@gmail.com>; Tanya Panzer <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 935 Woodbridge Street

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Hi Mai,

Thank you for your assistance with this matter. We went ahead and paid everything for 2023. | also called
Ramsey County Property Tax Record and updated the address so hopefully we start receiving all of these
letters and notices. | also have someone going out to upkeep the property this week.

Regarding the 2024 notices, the pictures you sent over do not reflect our property. | will be sure to be
available during that hearing time but would expect that this issue would be dropped since it is not our

property and we do have someone regularly caring for the lawn.

Please let me know if there is anything else you think we should be doing to help resolve these issues, and
again | appreciate all of your assistance.

Have a splendid day.

Amanda Bugge

From: Mai Vang <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 6:04 AM




To: Amanda Bugge <amanda.bugge@hotmail.com>
Cc: steve bugge <stevenbugge@gmail.com>; Tanya Panzer <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: 935 Woodbridge Street

Hello Ms. Bugge,

Your hearing is not until September 17, 2024 via telephone hearing between 10AM-12PM. | will putyou
on the schedule for that day and if a hearing is not necessary, | will email you Monday, before the

hearing. Please provide your phone number once again for the hearing. As to mailing address, you may
want to contact Ramsey County Property Tax Record at 651-266-2000 (Ramsey County Website_) to
update your address as record still show you at the 935 Woodbridge Street address. Once thatis
updated, it will alert the Dept of Safety & Inspections and Assessment Office to change the record in their
system. | have copied Tanya Panzer, Assessment Office, in this email.

Mai Viang

(She, her)

Legislative Hearing Coordinator | St Paul City Council
M: (651) 266-8585 ; D: (651) 266-8563

310 City Hall, 15 W. Kellogg Blvd, St Paul, MN 55102

Y'Y SAINT PAUL
LLLLE MINNESOTA

From: Amanda Bugge <amanda.bugge@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2024 1:32 PM

To: Mai Vang <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: steve bugge <stevenbugge@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: 935 Woodbridge Street

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Hi Mai,

Thank you for your time with this issue. As expected, that is not our house. Our lot does not have a house on it
and according to those pictures, the house listed there has an address of 945.

How do you think we should proceed?

Also, | am worried we will not receive any letter if it is sent to 935 Woodbridge since we never received any of
the previous correspondence. Can | provide a different address for the city to put on file for any
correspondence with our address?

Again, thank you for your help with this matter. Have a splendid day.

Amanda Bugge



From: Mai Vang <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2024 10:16 AM

To: amanda.bugge@hotmail.com <amanda.bugge@hotmail.com>
Subject: 935 Woodbridge Street

Hello Ms. Bugge,

Per our phone conversation, your assessment hearing is not until September 17, 2024 which you will get
a letter. Here attached are the photos and order issued by the inspector and city crew that did the
work. If you still wish to appeal, call me back when you get the letter.

Thanks.

Mai Viang

(She, her)

Legislative Hearing Coordinator | St Paul City Council
M: (651) 266-8585 ; D: (651) 266-8563

310 City Hall, 15 W. Kellogg Blvd, St Paul, MN 55102

SAINT PAUL
LI MINNESOTA



