Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Moermond, Marcia (ClI-StPaul)
Sent: Monday, August 28, 2017 10:16 AM
To: Vang, Mai (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: RE: VBR 17-27 - 854 Lawson Ave E

Yes, please do.

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, August 25, 2017 10:47 AM
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)
Subject: VBR 17-27 - 854 Lawson Ave E

Marcia,
Owner called and stated he got assessed for the whole VB fee. This fee should be deleted since owner got his cc report
on June 23. You gave him 90 days to complete the project from March 28.

Can | do a resolution to amend?

Mai



