Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, July 18, 2019 12:07 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Moermond, Marcia (Cl-StPaul); Chao, Diana (Cl-StPaul); Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1723 Minnehaha Ave. W. Q1 2019 assessment

Here is the email for 1723 Minnehaha Ave. W

Chris

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 9:02 AM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 1723 Minnehaha Ave. W. Q1 2019 assessment

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see Lisa’s update below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Lisa Wegleitner <lwegleitner21@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 8:51 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: Re: 1723 Minnehaha Ave. W. Q1 2019 assessment

They paid part of Q2 check #19165

amount of $109.19

5-20-19. That is the only payment we have received.
Just to be more clear.

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 15, 2019, at 3:53 PM, <grevering.sph@gmail.com> <grevering.sph@gmail.com> wrote:

Please see request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com




763-295-2054

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Monday, July 15, 2019 3:51 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: 1723 Minnehaha Ave. W. Q1 2019 assessment

Hi Gene,

This resident submitted a complaint for the legislative hearing scheduled 7/18. They said they already
paid their Q1 2019 bill to genes? Do you have any record of this payment? Thanks

Chris



