From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)

To: harris.brendan13@gmail.com
cc: *CI-StPaul -Counci
Subject: RE: Appealing assessment #205600 - 286 Forbes
Date: Friday, April 9, 2021 2:45:54 PM
286 Forhes Ave RC Summary pdf
286 Forbes Ave Invoice.pdf
imaae004.onq
Brendan,

The sealcoating is preventative maintenance performed on residential streets every eight years. The assessment, if not paid, is spread out over 8 years and collected through property taxes. | have attached a copy of
the Ramsey County Summary showing the frontage for your property and a copy of the original invoice sent.

Additional information regarding the Street Maintenance Service Program (SMSP) can be found at https://www.stpaul.gov/departments/financial-services/street-maintenance-service-program.
The SMSP fees are calculated by multiplying your property’s street/alley frontage by the established rates.

Here are the details for your property:

Alley 49’ x $5.23 = $256.27

Street 49’ x $6.63 = $324.87

Please let me know if you have any additional questions.

Thank you,
Lynn
Lynn M. Rolf
Assessments Supervisor
ARAR Office of Financial Services - Assessments
700 City Hall

15 West Kellogg Boulevard
SAINT PAUL Saint Paul, MN 55102

MINNESOTA P: 651-266-8851
lynn.rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov/assessments

From: Brendan Harris <harris.brendan1. mail.com>

Sent: Friday, April 9, 2021 11:13 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Fwd: Appealing assessment #205600

Begin forwarded message:

From: Brendan Harris <harris.brendan1 mail.com
Subiect: A I

Date: April 9, 2021 at 11:07:58 AM CDT

To: il@ci

| am emailing to object the assessment. | am objecting because | have not been notified as to why | am receiving an invoice for $581.00. For sealcoating alley and forbes. What is the 49 ft? Is that my
property footage in the front and back? Or is 49 ft the same charge that my neighbors have received.

Thanks

Brendan
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Tax Classification
Roll Type
Municipality
School District
Watershed

TIF District

Land Use Code

Taxpayers

=R RAMSEY COUNTY
Pay Property Tax
Pay Property Taxes
Summary View
Parcel ID 012823420035
Parcel Status Active
Property Address 286 FORBES AVE
ST PAUL, MN 55102-2338
Sec/Twp/Rng 01/028/023
Brief Tax Description Lot 54 of WHITACRE BRISBINE & MULLENS SU
LOT 54
(Note: Not to be used on legal documents)
Parcel Area 0.14 Acres
Parcel Width 49 Feet
Parcel Depth 123 Feet

(Note: Width and Depth represent buildable area of lot in the case of irregularly shaped lots)
1A-Residential Homestead

Real Property

ST PAUL

ISD #625

CAPITAL REGION W/S

510 R - SINGLE FAMILY DWELLING, PLATTED LOT

* The Tax Classification is the Assessor Office’s determination of the use of the property and is not the same as the property’s zoning.
* Please contact the zoning authority for information regarding zoning.

*To determine whether your property is Abstract or Torrens, call 651-266-2050

Please refer to disclaimer at bottom of this page

Type
Owner

Current Tax Year

Address

286 Forbes Ave
Saint Paul MN 55102-3520

Name
Brendan P Harris

*Information listed is as of yesterday. For specific payoff information contact Property Tax Info at 651-266-2000

First Half Due 05-17-2021

Second Half Due 10-15-2021

Amount Due $1,837.00 Amount Due $1,837.00
Penalty & Fees (thru current month)  $0.00 Penalty & Fees (thru current month)  $0.00
Sub Total $1,837.00 Sub Total $1,837.00
Payments Made $0.00 Payments Made $0.00
Balance Due $1,837.00 Balance Due $1,837.00

Total Due $3,674.00

https://beacon.schneidercorp.com/application.aspx? AppID=959&LayerID=18852&PageTy...

4/9/2021
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- City of Saint Paul
INVOICE

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA
OWNER OR TAXPAYER

Brendan P Harris Property Address: 286 FORBES AVE

286 Forbes Ave Property ID Number:  01-28-23-42-0035

St Paul MN 55102-3520
Project Number: 205600
AMOUNT DUE: $581.14

FEE FOR WORK 2020 Street Maintenance Service Program - Sealcoating Street and/or Alley

PERFORMED
ASSESSMENT  Sealcoating - Alley (1) 49.00 X  $5.23 / foot = $256.27
CALCULATION Sealcoating - Forbes (6) 49.00 X $6.63 / foot = $324.87

FEE The City of Saint Paul is authorized under Chapter 429 of the Minnesota State Statutes and Chapters 62
AUTHORIZATION and 64 of the Saint Paul Administrative Code to charge fees to property owners for various services
provided through its Street Maintenance Service Program. Those services include Mill and Overlay and
Sealcoating projects.

PAYMENT You may pay the full amount of your fee or a portion of it by 3/5/2021 without interest. Please enclose the
INFORMATION lower portion of this invoice with your payment.

If you do not pay the fee by 3/5/2021, the amount due will become an assessment on your property. Each
year an installment will be sent to Ramsey County for collection with your property taxes. Any unpaid
amount will be charged interest at 1.75% per year, plus an annual $1.30 flat fee per city ordinance to
cover administrative costs related to the assessment.

Per city ordinance you will be allowed 8 years to pay the assessment. If you wish to shorten the term of
the assessment, the City will accept additional payments each year until NOVEMBER 15th.

Returned checks are subject to a $30.00 returned item fee.
(Continued on reverse side.)

(Return this portion with your payment)

OWNER OR TAXPAYER Property Address: 286 FORBES AVE
Brendan P Harris Property ID Number: 01-28-23-42-0035
286 Forbes Ave Project Number: 205600
St Paul MN 55102-3520 AMOUNT DUE: $581.14

Make checks payable to the CITY OF SAINT PAUL and mail to:

Office of Financial Services - Assessments
700 City Hall
15 West Kellogg Boulevard
Saint Paul MN 55102 - 1658






SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA







