
1

Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Thursday, October 1, 2020 10:37 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1034 Case ave

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Resolved! 
 
cs 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 1, 2020 10:24 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 1034 Case ave 
 
Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Chris, 
Please see update from Kim. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Kim Shannon <Kim.Shannon@advanceddisposal.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 1, 2020 10:24 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Jim Smith <Jim.Smith@advanceddisposal.com>; Julie Miron <Julie.Miron@advanceddisposal.com>; Tim Williams 
<Tim.Williams@advanceddisposal.com> 
Subject: 1034 Case ave 
 
Good morning, 
I thought I had already sent this. 
Please do not charge for Tax Roll $54.36 for Q2. 
 
 
Thank you 
 
Kim Shannon | Operations Support/Administrative Assistant 
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309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN  55103 
T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552  | E: kim.shannon@AdvancedDisposal.com 
Connect with us:     AdvancedDisposal.com     Facebook      YouTube 
 


