
From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)
To: dmschleiter@gmail.com
Cc: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council
Subject: RE: 406 Wacouta - Assessment#200025
Date: Monday, November 9, 2020 5:58:14 PM
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John,
 
The Public Hearing Notice and your payment crossed in the mail.  Please disregard the Notice because your payment has been applied.
 
Thank you,
Lynn

 
 

From: Dori Schleiter <dmschleiter@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 10:02 AM
To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Assessment#200025
 

Hello, 
I am writing in response to a letter I received (see attached) regarding a hearing on November 18. My check was cashed on October 30, 2020, check #4720.  Please confirm that I am paid
in full and the amount will not be added to my property tax statement with the interest charge.  Thank you!
John Schleiter
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Office of Financial Services/Real Estate
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