Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, June 10, 2021 9:34 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Gaoshoua Vang
Subject: RE: 2015 Ivy Ave E, J2119A

The Property Clean up was paid in full on 5/21/2021 by Arden Title LLC.

Tanya ) Panzer

Office of Financial Services - Assessments

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 700 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8858 | D: (651) 266-6153

Assessment Look Up- www.stpaul.gov/assessments

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, June 10, 2021 9:30 AM

To: Gaoshoua Vang <gaoshoua.vang@gmail.com>

Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: 2015 Ivy Ave E, J2119A

Ms. Vang,

Per our phone conversation, | will have Ms. Panzer check to see when it was paid and by whom. If it was
paid at closing, you will no longer need to appeal and | will remove the file for June 22" and you will not
get an invoice after August 4™.

Mai Vang

City Council Offices - Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals - www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

From: Gaoshoua Vang <gaoshoua.vang@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 9, 2021 4:13 PM




To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 2015 Ivy Ave E

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Hello Mai,
We just moved in on May 14, 2021. Is there someone who | can talk to about this?

Best phone to reach me is at 651-558-1655.

Thank you,
Gao Vang

On Wed, Jun 9, 2021, 2:53 PM Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Hello Ms. Vang,

See attached order and photo regarding the clean up on March 11, 2021. Videos were sent separately.

Mai Vang

City Council Offices - Legislative Hearings
15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals - www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings




