Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, October 18, 2021 4:30 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: 1774 REANEY AVENUE - Quarter 2 (April - June)2021 Assessment Inquiry

We have still not received a response on this inquiry. Please respond by tomorrow at 12:00 PM. If we have not heard
from Advanced Disposal by then, we will be reducing the assessment to $63.25 to just reflect the time period of May
and June when the property owner claimed that they did have service.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury
A Management Assistant | - Citywide Garbage Program
Pronouns: she/her/hers

Department of Public Works

SAINT PAUL 800 City Hall Annex

MINNESOTA 25 West Fourth St
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, October 14, 2021 4:33 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: 1774 REANEY AVENUE - Quarter 2 (April - June)2021 Assessment Inquiry

Have we received a response on this? If not, please respond by tomorrow at 5:00 PM as there is a hearing for this
property next week.

Thank you!



Clare Pillsbury
* Management Assistant | - Citywide Garbage Program
Pronouns: she/her/hers

Department of Public Works

SAINT PAUL 800 CCity Hall Annex

MINNESOTA 25 West Fourth St
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, October 12, 2021 5:35 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: 1774 REANEY AVENUE - Quarter 2 (April - June)2021 Assessment Inquiry
Importance: Low

Please forward to Advanced Disposal

Property Address & PID: 1774 REANEY AVENUE & 272922440073

Property Owner: Shawn Cagle

Phone Number: 651-600-6861

Email: s.cagle@aol.com

Pending Assessment Amount: $109.06

Quarter Pending Assessment if for: Quarter 2 (April - June) 2021 Delinquent Garbage Assessment

Summary of Issue: Property owner stead that they moved in April 2021 and stated that they did not receive garbage
until May 2021. Therefore resident does not want to pay for the month that service was not provided. Please confirm
whether there was a cart at the property in April 2021 and provide the following information for Q1 — Q3 2021:

- Any changes to the account (vacancies, cart swaps, etc)
- Itemized breakdown of invoice

- Payment history

- Contact with property owner

Thank You,



A

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

Clare Pillsbury
Management Assistant | - Citywide Garbage Program
Pronouns: she/her/hers

Department of Public Works
800 City Hall Annex

25 West Fourth St

Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov




