Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2022 12:47 PM

To: Support (Zendesk)

Cc: Haas, Sarah (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: FW: FW: 778 6th St E, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) -

Assessment Inquiry

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Please see WM update.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2022 12:27 PM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: FW: 778 6th St E, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) - Assessment Inquiry

15t Qtr 2022 -1-96 gal trash & 1-64 gal trash plus taxes.

01/06/22 MISCTAX INV T1A 14.40 14.40
01/06/22 MISCTAX INV T1I 41.34 55.74
01/06/22 INV 06A  147.63 203.37

03/14/22 IVR-VISA PMT SLB 203.37 .00

2" Qtr 2022 -1-96 gal trash & 1-64 gal trash, taxes and 3 finance charges — plus the $100 payment

04/05/22 MISCTAX INV T1A 14.40 14.40
04/05/22 MISCTAX INV T1I 41.34 55.74
04/05/22 INV 06A  147.63 203.37
04/28/22 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 10.16 213.53
05/21/22 1040 PMT SLB 100.00 113.53
05/27/22 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 5.67 119.20
06/27/22 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 5.68 124.88
07/05/22 ST PAUL BAL PMT MSC 124.88 .00

3rd Qtr 2022- 1-96 gal trash & 1-64 gal trash, taxes and 2 finance charges so far.
07/06/22 MISCTAX INV T1A 14.40 14.40
07/06/22 MISCTAX INV T1I 41.34 55.74



07/06/22 INV 06A  147.63 203.37

07/28/22 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 10.16 213.53

08/31/22 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 10.16 223.69
Tot 223.69

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2022 11:43 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 778 6th St E, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) - Assessment Inquiry

Mary,
Please see request from Clare.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Clare (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2022 9:42 AM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Sarah Haas <sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: Re: 778 6th St E, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) - Assessment Inquiry

Hello Greg,

Can you ask if they can get us a response by tomorrow at 10:00 AM? | realize that | didn't specify a time frame but
since we have a hearing for this assessment coming up, | will need a response by then.

Thanks!

Clare Pillsbury

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@oci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage

On Tue, September 27 at 10:14, Clare Pillsbury wrote:

Hello,



We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 778 6th St E, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106. Please forward to Waste
Management for their input.

Ticket ID#: 12755

Ticket Requester: Patrick Lee

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16517718398
Property ID #: 322922140046

Property Address: 778 6th St E, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106
Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 2 (April - June)
Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2022

Pending Assessment Amount: $124.88

Hauler: Waste Management

Ticket Comments: Please provide the following information for Q1 2022 - Q3 2022:

- Iltemized breakdown of invoice
- Payment history
- Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



