Derek Thooft Mail - Fwd: Payment Confirmation for Property Taxes for Ramsey County 3/7/22, 1:37 PM

M Gmail

Fwd: Payment Confirmation for Property Taxes for Ramsey County

Lorie Miller <focusandsucceed1@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 22, 2022 at 8:39 AM
To: Derek Thooft <thooftlaw@gmail.com>, Derek Thooft <derek@thooftlawllc.com>, Keats McGraw
<keats@thooftlawllc.com>, "Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)" <joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Ramsey County <epaynoreply@usbank.com>

Date: Tuesday, February 22, 2022

Subject: Payment Confirmation for Property Taxes for Ramsey County
To: focusandsucceed1@gmail.com

*** PLEASE DO NOT RESPOND TO THIS EMAIL ***
Thank you for your payment.
This email is to confirm your payment submitted on Feb-22-2022 for Property Taxes for Ramsey County.

Confirmation Number: RC1RR4000571072
Payment Amount: $5,456.01

Convenience Fee: $1.00

Total Amount: $5,457.01

Scheduled Payment Date: Feb-22-2022

Account Nickname: N/A

Routing Transit Number: 086300012
Account Number: *0795

Account Type: Checking

Account Category: Business

If you have questions about this payment or need assistance, please view the payment online at
https://www.ramseycounty.us/taxvaluelookup , or call Customer Service at (651)266-2000.

The above payment was processed with authorization to make a single entry ACH debit of the above listed account. If
you did not authorize this payment please contact Customer Service at (651)266-2000.

Thank you for using the Ramsey County Property Tax electronic payment system.

U.S. BANCORP made the following annotations

Electronic Privacy Notice. This e-mail, and any attachments, contains information that is, or may be, covered by
electronic communications privacy laws, and is also confidential and proprietary in nature. If you are not the intended
recipient, please be advised that you are legally prohibited from retaining, using, copying, distributing, or otherwise
disclosing this information in any manner. Instead, please reply to the sender that you have received this
communication in error, and then immediately delete it. Thank you in advance for your cooperation.
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