Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Monday, October 11, 2021 11:10 AM
To: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: FW: 1501 Eleanor and 1769 Marshall

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see update from Advanced.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com>

Sent: Monday, October 11, 2021 10:17 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>
Cc: Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com>

Subject: RE: FW: 1501 Eleanor and 1769 Marshall

We are waiting for an answer from our billing department.

Julie Miron
Office Manager
St. Paul Hauling & Transfer
imiron@wm.com

T: 651.287.5280
C: 612.232.9161
309 Como Ave

St. Paul, MN 55103
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Advarced
Disposal

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, October 11, 2021 09:59

To: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com>
Cc: Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1501 Eleanor and 1769 Marshall

Kim,



Please see request from Sarah.

Greg Reveting

Chief Manager

St. Paul Haulers LLC.
grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, October 11, 2021 9:53 AM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Cc: Young, Susan (CI-StPaul) <Susan.Young@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: 1501 Eleanor and 1769 Marshall

Advanced

We are still waiting for an answer on this. Please reply by the end of business today (5 pm) as we have a
hearing for this account on Thursday. If we do not hear back, we will remove both assessments from the
tax roll and hauler payment.

Thank you-

'*' Sarah Haas
Solid Waste Program Specialist
Pronouns: She/Her
SAINT PAUL PfJb|IC Works, Citywide Garbage Program
sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

From: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, October 7, 2021 3:59 PM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Cc: Young, Susan (CI-StPaul) <Susan.Young@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 1501 Eleanor and 1769 Marshall

Please forward to Advanced.

Kim

When looking at these two accounts it appears that Advanced submitted Q1 unpaid bills combined with
Q2 unpaid bills in the Q2 tax roll sent to the city. The deadline for submitting Quarter 1 unpaid bills was
April 5 and previous quarter delinquent accounts cannot be added to future assessments. Why was this
done?



Sarah Haas

Solid Waste Program Specialist
Pronouns: She/Her

SAINT PAUL Pf,lbhc Works, Citywide Garbage Program
sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



