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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Thursday, September 23, 2021 9:22 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 822 Edmund Ave - Q2 2021 Assessment
Attachments: 12.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Good  morning, I attached the payment receipt for 822 Edmund ave, the project number is CG2103A4, let me know if 
you need anything else!  
Have a good day 
 
 
 
Lindsay Butterfield 
Office of Financial Services - Assessments 
700 City Hall 
15 West Kellogg Boulevard 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
Lindsay.butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
651-266-6343 
 
 

 
 
 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 22, 2021 4:34 PM 
To: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) <Lindsay.Butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 822 Edmund Ave - Q2 2021 Assessment 
 
Hey Lindsay, 
 
Could you provide the project number for me for the Q2 2021 assessment for 822 Edmund Ave? If you could also tell me 
when the assessment was paid and who paid it, that would be great.  



2

 
Thanks! 
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I - Citywide Garbage Program
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
 
Department of Public Works  
800 City Hall Annex 
25 West Fourth St 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
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