Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Monday, October 4, 2021 8:11 AM

To: Haas, Sarah (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: FW: Fwd: 1706 Sims Ave - Quarter 2 (April - June) 2021 Assessment Inquiry
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see update from Kim.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>

Sent: Monday, October 4, 2021 8:06 AM

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com>; Koupal, Matthew
<mkoupal@wm.com>

Subject: RE: Fwd: 1706 Sims Ave - Quarter 2 (April - June) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

Payment was made in August. I have done 2 reverses on tax roll for the late fees in July and August.



tovoie et s

Info Trans, Date Trans. Type Description
0001-003 1fafz021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 11312021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 1fzoizo021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 1z7iz0z1 Service RESI ALLEY !
0001-003 2i3/z021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 2i10iz2021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 211712021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 212412021 Service RESI ALLEY !
0001-003 332021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 3ioiz0z1 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 37iz0z1 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 32402021 Service RESI ALLEY !
0001-003 3312021 Service RESI ALLEY ¢
0001-003 41512021 Period TRASH STAR
0001-9949 41512021 Tax MMrsh askel
0001-9949 44512021 Tax RR Cky Envir
44302021 Adjustment LATE FEE
53102021 Adjustrment LATE FEE
BI3002021 Adjustment LATE FEE
7212021 Adjustment ST PAUL TAk
7232021 Adjustment ST PALL Takx
aizlznz1 Payment Remate Dep
Thank you

Kim Shannon | Operations Specialist/Scale Operator

Advanced w
Disposal

309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN 55103

T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552 | E: kshannon@wm.com

Connect with us: AdvancedDisposal.com Facebook YouTube

From: Greg Revering [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 4:34 PM

To: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com>; Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1706 Sims Ave - Quarter 2 (April - June) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

Kim,
Please see the information and request from Clare.

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:
From: "Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)" <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Date: September 27, 2021 at 3:32:03 PM CDT
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com




Cc: "Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul)" <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 1706 Sims Ave - Quarter 2 (April - June) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

Please forward to Advanced Disposal

Property Address & PID: 1706 Sims Ave & 272922410103

Property Owner: Tu Lay

Phone Number: 651-278-9735

Email: najasmine97 @gmail.com

Pending Assessment Amount: $116.38

Quarter Pending Assessment if for: Quarter 2 (April - June) 2021 Delinquent Garbage Assessment

Summary of Issue: Property owner stated that they already made a payment for Q2 2021. Please
provide the following information for Q2 — Q3 2021:

- Itemized breakdown of invoice
- Payment history
- Contact with property owner

Thank You,
Clare Pillsbury
'*' Management Assistant | - Citywide Garbage Program
ARAA Pronouns: she/her/hers

Department of Public Works

SAINT PAUL 800 City Hall Annex

MINNESOTA 25 West Fourth St
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov




