Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 1:56 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: FW: FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Great, we will remove the assessment. | will have Clare follow up with this resident and outline the process.

Chris

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 10:16 AM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: FW: FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see confirmation from Kim.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 10:03 AM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com’' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Miron, Julie <jimiron@wm.com>
Cc: Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com>

Subject: RE: FW: FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

That would be great.
Thank you

Kim Shannon | Operations Specialist/Scale Operator

WARTE _quqnimu‘--
309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN 55103
T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552 | E: kshannon@wm.com
Connect with us: AdvancedDisposal.com Facebook YouTube




From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 9:45 AM

To: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com>

Cc: Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

Kim,
Please see question from Chris.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, July 6, 2021 9:20 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

Do you want us to remove the assessment? That could be easier than putting a credit on the account.

Chris

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, July 5, 2021 6:10 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see update from Kim.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>

Sent: Monday, July 5, 2021 8:58 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry

There are no conversations recorded regarding this issue.
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Here is the history of invoice. I will enter a credit for the $5.06.

invce o r

Trans, Dake Trans, Type Descripkion
0001-004 1142021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 17112021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 171812021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 1/25/2021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 2/1}z2021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 2lafzoz1 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 2/15/2021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 2lzzlz20z1 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 3/1/2021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 3fafz021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 3/15/2021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 3z2ziz0z1 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 3/29/2021 Service RESI ALLEY SE
0001-004 452021 Period TRASH STARMD,
0001-005 4/5/2021 Period YARDWASTE 5
0001-999 4/5/2021 Tax Py sWi asteragl
001-999 41512021 Tax RR. Cky Envirar

4162021 Adjustrnent Of ACCOUMT

4162021 Adjustrment O ACCOUMT

41212021 Payment Paymode Auto
Thank you

Kim Shannon | Operations Specialist/Scale Operator

Advanced w
Disposal

309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN 55103

T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552 | E: kshannon@wm.com

Connect with us: AdvancedDisposal.com Facebook YouTube

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 5:26 PM

To: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com>

Cc: Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry
Importance: Low

Kim,
Please see the information and request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.
grevering.sph@gmail.com




763-295-2054

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 5:17 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 1677 Thomas Ave - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry
Importance: Low

Please forward to Advanced Disposal

Property Address & PID: 1677 Thomas Ave & 332923110204

Property Owner: Janice Grudecki

Phone Number: 651-329-1105

Pending Assessment Amount: $5.06

Quarter Pending Assessment if for: Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Delinquent Garbage Assessment

Summary of Issue: Property owner was promised by “the Head of the Department” at Advanced that a $5.00 error in
billing made by Advanced would be fixed. Please confirm this and provide the following information for Q1 2021:

- ltemized breakdown of invoice
- Payment history
- Contact with property owner

Thank You,

Clare Pillsbury
'*' Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works
Pronouns: she/her/hers

Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Bivd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 651-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



