Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, July 8, 2021 3:22 PM

To: Anderson, Susan (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: Info from Vaugn S. at 1505 Albany Ave.
FYI

Clare Pillsbury
'*' Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works

Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Bivd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 651-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Wednesday, July 7, 2021 2:02 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: Info from Vaugn S. at 1505 Albany Ave.

Can you follow up with this resident about the assessment?

Cs

From: Parisi, Juliet (CI-StPaul) <Juliet.Parisi@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Wednesday, July 7, 2021 1:41 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Info from Vaugn S. at 1505 Albany Ave.

Chris,

As per our chat yesterday, please review the information below regarding my call with the property owner at 1505
Albany Ave.

Property owner: Vaugn S.

651-645-5740

Has a Delinquent Garbage bill for Jan — March 2021

Son paid Aspen on Vaugn’s Master CC in mid-May due to Vaugn being in Hospital
Wanted to let us know the City Garbage program is “doing a good job”
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Let me know if you have any questions.

A

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

Juliet Parisi

Pronouns: She/Her/Hers

Customer Service Representative
Department of Safety & Inspections
375 Jackson Street, Suite 220

Saint Paul, MN 55101

P: 651-266-8989
juliet.parisi@ci.stpaul.mn.us
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