From: Niqui Ruiz

To: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul

Subject: Re: 666 Arlington Ave.Ruiz Ltr.7-30-21

Date: Monday, August 2, 2021 6:39:26 PM
Attachments: WORK PLAN - breakdown costs for rehab.docx

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

1 have attached the work plan that you sent to me, filled in to the best of my ability. I am not sure
of exact costs though I am not sure how that is relevant as long as the work is getting done. [ am
still not sure what documentation i need to provide in order to prove that I have the deed in my
name now, as the photos of the notarized quit claim deed were not sufficient, so I will wait until
tomorrow.

On Mon, Aug 2, 2021 at 12:08 PM Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul) <joanna.zimny(@ci.stpaul. mn.us>
wrote:

The number we call from is from a Microsoft Teams appointment and cannot be called. I know
you talked to our front desk clerk Janis Peterson later that afternoon but we only have staff for
those appeals for a certain length of time.

If you’re having issues tomorrow at all, please call 651-266-8585 right away to connect with
staff.

Thanks,

Joanna

From: Niqui Ruiz <niquitinar@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, August 2, 2021 11:27 AM

To: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul) <joanna.zimny(@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang(@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 666 Arlington Ave.Ruiz Ltr.7-30-21

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.
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WORK PLAN - BREAKDOWN COST OF REHABILATION 

(To be done in accordance with the Code Compliance Inspection Report)    Address: _666 Arlington Avenue East, Saint Paul_





		WEEK

OF

		TASKS

		CONTRACTOR

		Supplies/Materials 

on hand (if any)

		Needed Supplies/Materials

		Owner/Developer

Labor

		Value of 

Cost

		Completed

		In Progress



		8/2/2021

		item 1

		none

		none needed

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$0

		✓

		



		8/2/2021

		item 2

		none

		none needed

		none

		Aaron Stephenson

		$0

		✓

		



		8/2/2021

		item 3

		none

		none needed

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$0

		✓

		



		8/2/2021

		item 4

		none

		paint, a bagster, some cleaning supplies on hand

		bagsters to remove debris, cleaning supplies

		Nichole Ruiz

		roughly $210 per bagster, cleaning supplies and paint as needed / unsure

		

		✓



		8/2/2021

		item 5

		none

		none needed

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$0

		✓

		



		8/9/2021

		item 6

		Damian Pelletier

		some tiles, paint, linoleum, wood paneling

		not sure yet

		Damian Pelletier

		unknown

		

		



		8/2/2021

		item 7

		none

		rakes, shovels, etc

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$0

		

		✓



		8/16/2021

		item 8

		Mat Graske

		paint, brushes, etc

		tbd

		Mat Graske

		unknown

		

		



		8/2/2021

		item 9

		Eric Ransom

		screen and handle

		none

		Eric Ransom

		$18

		✓

		



		8/23/2021

		item 10

		Mike Rodger

		paint, brushes, etc

		unknown

		Mike Rodger

		tbd

		

		



		8/9/2021

		item 11

		Damian Pelletier

		paint, brushes, etc

		none

		Damian Pelletier

		$35

		

		



		8/16/2021

		item 12

		Mat Graske

		hammer, nails, etc

		none

		Mat Graske

		$0

		

		



		8/2/2021

		item 13

		none

		none needed

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$0

		✓

		



		8/30/2021

		item 14

		none

		storage bins, shelving

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$0

		

		✓



		8/2/2021

		item 15

		none

		none

		none

		Mike Rodger

		$0

		✓

		



		8/2/2021

		item 16

		none

		garbage bins

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$0

		✓

		



		8/2/2021

		item 17

		none

		smoke detectors

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$135

		✓

		



		8/2/2021

		item 18

		none

		CO2 detectors

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$80

		✓

		



		8/4/2021

		item 19

		Ben King

		deed

		official copy?

		Nichole Ruiz / Pamela Brown

		$53

		

		✓



		tbd

		item 20

		dsi

		unsure

		unsure

		tbd

		tbd

		

		



		8/2/2021

		item 21

		none

		traps, fly strips, etc

		none

		Nichole Ruiz

		$200

		✓

		



		8/18/2021

		item 22

		Arcade Animal Hospital

		none

		dog licenses

		Nichole Ruiz

		$240

		

		✓



		8/2/2021

		item 23

		none

		traps, fly strips, etc

		none

		Nichole Ruiz / Mike Rodger

		$0

		✓

		



		

		

		

		

		

		

		

		

		



		

		

		

		

		

		

		

		

		



		

		

		

		

		

		

		

		

		





													



										Total Project Cost:	$____________________________







Note:  (Code Enforcement Officers estimate the cost to repair this structure is $_____________ to $_______________). 


Yes, that is correct. I called 4 times to try to connect with someone from the previous appeal
appointment.

On Mon, Aug 2, 2021, 11:17 AM Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
<joanna.zimny(@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Ms. Ruiz,

Ms. Moermond did ask me to confirm with you that you understand that non-participation in
the appeal tomorrow may result in the denial of your appeal and the condemnation and order
to vacate.

We tried calling you last week at: 651-278-6377. Can you confirm that is the correct
number?

Thanks,

Joanna

Joanna Zimny

Legislative Hearing Executive Assistant
Legislative Hearing Office

Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall

Suite 310
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.

Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8515

joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov
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From: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, August 2, 2021 8:33 AM

To: Niqui Ruiz <niquitinar@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: 666 Arlington Ave.Ruiz Ltr.7-30-21

Ms. Ruiz,

Ms. Moermond would like a plan that lays out the work to be done, the timeline in which it
will be addressed/completed, specifically. Keeping in mind life safety items should be
prioritized (which I believe are 2-5 and 13, 17, and 21) and all items need to be completed
within a month. I have attached a copy of the orders, as well as a blank work plan we use for
certain other appeals, but you may find helpful.

As far as the quit claim deed, you can speak to Ms. Moermond about that tomorrow. I’'m not
really certain her line of thinking on that. If you have proof that you’ve actually submitted
the document that may help.

Thanks,

Joanna
Joanna Zimny
Legislative Hearing Executive Assistant
Legislative Hearing Office
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Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall
X

Suite 310
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15 W. Kellogg Blvd.
Saint Paul, MN 55102
P:651-266-8515

joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov

From: Niqui Ruiz <niquitinar(@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 30, 2021 5:26 PM

To: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul) <joanna.zimn i.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 666 Arlington Ave.Ruiz Ltr.7-30-21

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

What is does an acceptable work plan look like? I have been working on the items on the list
that we were given initially and I addressed that in my last email. The documents I submitted
with the email were a notarized copy of the deed which we got at the housing office on
Plato, in Saint Paul. What is an acceptable document to show ownership?

On Fri, Jul 30, 2021 at 9:20 AM Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
<joanna.zimny(@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Attached please find a letter regarding the above matter.
Thank you,

Joanna

Joanna Zimny
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Legislative Hearing Executive Assistant
Legislative Hearing Office

Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall

Suite 310
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Saint Paul, MN 55102
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