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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, July 2, 2021 10:44 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: FW: 1357 JESSIE ST  - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry
Attachments: 3.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

This might be it, this is the only payment close to that time. 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 2, 2021 10:15 AM 
To: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) <Lindsay.Butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: 1357 JESSIE ST - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry 
 
Hello Lindsay. 
 
Can you check to see if the city received a payment for any assessments related to 1357 Jessie St around 4/1/2021? If so, 
please let me know who made the payment and what the payment was for. 
 
Thank you! Have a great weekend.  
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works  
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
Saint Paul City Hall Annex 
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.  
Saint Paul, MN 55102  
P: 651-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 

   
   
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 5:39 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) 
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: 1357 JESSIE ST - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
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Clare, 
Please see question from Mary. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 5:38 PM 
To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: 1357 JESSIE ST - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry 
 
How did they pay the city for this assessment on  4.1.21 when we hadn’t even sent over any balances for 1st Qtr yet. 
It states below they paid the Office of Finance that is WM  
 
Mary Patch   
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 5:25 PM 
To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1357 JESSIE ST - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry 
Importance: Low 
 
Mary, 
Please see the information and request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 1, 2021 5:14 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 1357 JESSIE ST - Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021 Assessment Inquiry 
Importance: Low 
 

Please forward to Waste Management 
 
Property Address & PID: 1357 JESSIE ST & 202922310130 
Property Owner: Kong Meng Thao 
Phone Number: 651-230-6028 
Pending Assessment Amount: $225.44 
Quarter Pending Assessment if for: Quarter 1 (January - March) 2021Delinquent Garbage Assessment 
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Summary of Issue: Property owner stated that they paid the city for this assessment on April 1 by check to the Office of 
Financial Services. The check was cashed on April 16. Please confirm when the payment was received and how it was 
applied to the account and provide the following information for Q1 2021 – Q2 2021: 

- Itemized breakdown of invoice 
- Payment history 
- Contact with property owner 

Thank You, 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works  
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
Saint Paul City Hall Annex 
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.  
Saint Paul, MN 55102  
P: 651-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 

   
   
 
 

 


