Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul)

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, June 17,2021 10:21 AM

To: Vang, Mai (Cl-StPaul); Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: Public Hearing CHCH Property Assessment

CO Commercial Initial Fee: $870.00 - Paid in Full: Yes - Payment Type: ASSESS - Payment Date: 05/06/2021 CO
Commercial Initial Fee: $870.00 - Paid in Full: Yes - Payment Type: ID - Payment Date: 05/28/2021

It looks like this was paid but after it was sent to the Assessment Office. A Resolution will need to be done to remove at
the PH on 8/18/2021.

Tanya J Panzer

Office of Financial Services - Assessments

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 700 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8858 | D: (651) 266-6153
Assessment Look Up- www.stpaul.gov/assessments

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 10:16 AM

To: Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul) <leanna.shaff@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Public Hearing CHCH Property Assessment

So assessed in error? If so, can you do a TA file. Thanks.

Mai Vang

City Council Offices — Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals — www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings

From: Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul) <leanna.shaff@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 10:14 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Public Hearing CHCH Property Assessment

Looks like it?



From: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 10:09 AM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul) <leanna.shaff@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Public Hearing CHCH Property Assessment

Can one of you check whether this was paid.

Mai Vang

City Council Offices — Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals — www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings

From: Seidenkranz, Cheryl L <cheryl.seidenkranz@CO.RAMSEY.MN.US>
Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 10:01 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Public Hearing CHCH Property Assessment

Good morning,

We received the attached hearing notice, however, we already paid the $870 certification of occupancy fee in March
2021, will this be a double charge/assessment to us? If so, | will need to protest or receive additional information as to
why we would pay it twice in one year.

Thank you,

Cheryl Seidenkranz | Building Services Manager Ramsey County, Property Management
120 Courthouse

15 West Kellogg Blvd

Saint Paul, MN 55102

Cell: (612) 419-6010



