
INVOICE

Junk Masters
PO Box 1184, Minnetonka, MN 55345
(612) 516-5865
info@junkmastersmn.com

Invoice # 3870
Date Tue Mar 23 2021

Balance 2787.70
Due On Mon Mar 22 2021

Bill To:
John Ray
655 east jessamain 
St. Paul , Minnesota 55101
(612) 805-5515
Golferjohn1962@gmail.com

Service Location:
John Ray
655 east jessamain 
St. Paul, Minnesota 55101
(612) 805-5515
 

Description QTY Price Amount

Mattress/Box spring
Recycling fee for mattress and or box spring

11 35 385.00

Small TV Recycling
TV up to 25" includes CRT TVs

2 30 60.00

E-Waste
Record player

1 30 30.00

Large TV Recycling
TV recycling 26'' and up includes CRT TVs

1 60 60.00

Computer monitor
Recycling of computer monitor(s)

1 15 15.00

E-Waste
Printer

1 30 30.00

Car / light truck tires
Car tire recycling fee

1 10 10.00

Full Load
Removal and haul away of junk/trash from property. Included
all items inside the home from basement to attic.

7 625 4375.00
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Labor
Additional labor per hour for two member crew. This cost is
for the additional bagging and scooping of items from around
home.

8 150 1200.00

Labor
Additional fee for PPE to keep crew safe while working
throughout house. Mainly basement.

1 300 300.00

Sub total 6465.00

Tax 322.70

Tax 7.38

Total 6787.70

Balance 2787.70

Description QTY Price Amount

Notes:

Thank You For Your Business!
JunkmastersMN.com

Please note: All County Enviromental Charges (CEC) are inclusive with the cost of junk removal
service. 

Page 2 of 2



From: John Ray
To: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
Subject: Fwd: Payment confirmation
Date: Monday, March 22, 2021 1:41:57 PM

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Workiz via WePay <support@wepay.com>
Date: Mon, Mar 22, 2021 at 8:55 AM
Subject: Payment confirmation
To: <Golferjohn1962@gmail.com>

You’ve made a $4,000.00 payment to Junk Masters -
info@junkmastersmn.com).

This charge will appear on your statement as “WPY*Junk Masters
infojunkmastersmncom”

To opt out of these notifications please go here

mailto:golferjohn1962@gmail.com
mailto:joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:support@wepay.com
mailto:Golferjohn1962@gmail.com
mailto:info@junkmastersmn.com
https://support.wepay.com/hc/en-us/requests/new
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