
From: Soley, Reid (CI-StPaul)
To: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul); Magner, Steve (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 864 Mariod PD
Date: Tuesday, March 9, 2021 8:09:11 AM
Attachments: image003.png

image004.png

The second $5,000 performance deposit for 864 Marion St. was processed this morning.
 
 

Reid Soley
DSI Inspector III
Department of Safety and Inspections 
375 Jackson St, Suite 220
Saint Paul, MN 55101
P: 651-266-9120
F: 651-266-1919
reid.soley@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov 
 

 
 

From: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul) <joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Sent: Monday, March 08, 2021 11:26 AM
To: Soley, Reid (CI-StPaul) <reid.soley@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 864 Mariod PD
 
Good morning Reid,
 
I just spoke with Richard Bowen the atty at this property who said that they posted the additional
$5k performance deposit last Friday; we didn’t see it as of 10 am this morning. Can you confirm this
was done before tomorrow’s Leg hearing?
 
Thank you!
Joanna
 
 

Joanna Zimny
Legislative Hearing Executive Assistant 
Legislative Hearing Office
Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall
Suite 310
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 612-266-8515 
joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov 
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