
AIVIRO'S *O*E IMPROVE.ME,NT & REMODELING

MarioConstruction I\dN@Gmail'com

PHONE 1763- 227-2A61

DATE 5l29l2o2a

ir\ivCieg #tCSS

BILL TO
Adam's Market

142 51h st E
St Paul, MN 55101

Details

Board uP windows, doors, entrance

Clean uP sidewalk and broken glass

$ignat*re:

FOR
EmergencY Call broken glass

ETd*UNT

$3,250.00
0.00%

$0.00
$3,250.00

SUBTOTAL
TAX RATE

OTHER
TOTAL

50% payment is due prior to start of work. 75% due halfiray through job'

Final payrnent due on completion of work'

Sign here indicating your agreement on prices anb conditions'

to

Thank y*u for Ycur business!

Page 1 of 1

p

$3,250.00



AI\{RO'S *O*E IMPRO\TE,ME,NT & REMODtrLING

MarioConstruction fullNQGmail'com

PHONE 1763- 227-2A61

DATE 5//2912020

ihrv{}lcH #*S*g

BILL TO
Adam's Market

1ae sllst r
St Paul, MN 55101

Details

Board uP windows, doors, entrance

Clean uP sidewalk and broken glass

Signature:

FOR
EmergencY Call broken glass

e*d*tlFJT

SUBTOTAL
TAX RATE

OTHER
TOTAL

50% payment is due prior to start of work. 75% due halfi,vay through job'

Final payrnent due on completion of work'

Sign here indicating your agreement on prices anb conditions'

b

Thank yau for Your business!

Page 1 of 1

fr

$3,250.00

$3,250.00
0.00%

$0.00
$3,250.00



From: Ayman Salama
To: Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Subject: Re: Appealed Tax assessment at 142 5th street east (File No. J2014B; Assessment No. 208115)
Date: Monday, November 16, 2020 9:51:15 PM
Attachments: image001.png

image002.png
image003.png
image004.png
image005.png
Invoice #1009 Adams market 5-29-2020-boarding-signed.pdf

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

I reached out to Mario and received the attached signed invoice that proves payment was
made.
Thanks,

Ayman
612-245-3555

Virus-free. www.avast.com

On Mon, Nov 16, 2020 at 7:11 AM Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
<joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Thank you, we will make sure Ms. Moermond sees this prior to your hearing.

 

I will note though, this is an invoice, that isn’t signed. Do you have proof of actual payment
to the contractor? That would help make it clearer the work was done.

 

Thanks,

Joanna

 

 

 

Joanna Zimny 
Executive Assistant
City Council Legislative Hearings
15 W. Kellogg Blvd - Suite 310
Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 651-266-8515

mailto:adamsmarket01@gmail.com
mailto:joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.avast.com/sig-email?utm_medium=email&utm_source=link&utm_campaign=sig-email&utm_content=webmail&utm_term=icon
https://www.avast.com/sig-email?utm_medium=email&utm_source=link&utm_campaign=sig-email&utm_content=webmail&utm_term=link
mailto:joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
http://www.stpaul.gov/
https://www.facebook.com/Ward1Office/
http://www.stpaul.gov/myt
http://www.stpaul.gov/mtw
https://public.govdelivery.com/accounts/STPAUL/subscriber/new?topic_id=STPAUL_1023
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AI\{RO'S *O*E IMPRO\TE,ME,NT & REMODtrLING
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DATE 5//2912020


ihrv{}lcH #*S*g


BILL TO
Adam's Market


1ae sllst r
St Paul, MN 55101
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Board uP windows, doors, entrance
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$3,250.00


$3,250.00
0.00%


$0.00
$3,250.00







Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America

 

 

 

 

From: Ayman Salama <adamsmarket01@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 13, 2020 4:43 PM
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
<joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Appealed Tax assessment at 142 5th street east (File No. J2014B; Assessment
No. 208115)

 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

 

I apologize for the delay. I was reviewing my calendar to check on the hearing date and
realized that I've responded yet. The copy of the boarding invoice is attached.

Thanks,

 

Ayman

612-245-3555

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com

 

On Wed, Oct 21, 2020 at 1:27 PM *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
<LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Good afternoon,

 

mailto:adamsmarket01@gmail.com
mailto:LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.avast.com/sig-email?utm_medium=email&utm_source=link&utm_campaign=sig-email&utm_content=webmail&utm_term=icon
https://www.avast.com/sig-email?utm_medium=email&utm_source=link&utm_campaign=sig-email&utm_content=webmail&utm_term=link
mailto:LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us


This email is to confirm that on October 20, 2020 at the Legislative Hearing, Marcia
Moermond, the Legislative Hearing Officer recommended laying the matter over to
Legislative Hearing Tuesday, November 17, 2020 between 9:00 and 10:30 am VIA
PHONE for further discussion.

 

Per the conversation, please email us a copy of your boarding invoice from Amros Home
Improvement for review prior to November 17th.

 

Thank you, please let me know if you have any questions,

 

Joanna

 

 

 

Joanna Zimny 
Executive Assistant
City Council Legislative Hearings
15 W. Kellogg Blvd - Suite 310
Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 651-266-8515

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America

 

 

 

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com
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