
1

Mai Vang

From: xsaota@yahoo.com
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2023 9:19 PM
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Subject: Re: 1019

 
Sound good any day of may for me thanks  

On Tuesday, April 18, 2023, 07:42:39 AM CDT, *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <legislativehearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
wrote:  
 
 

I will still have this for May 2nd because I have not prepared the file yet. 

  

Mai 

  

From: xsaota@yahoo.com <xsaota@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Monday, April 17, 2023 9:58 PM 
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Re: 1019 

  

 
Sorry yes 651 399 8206 
Saota Star  

On Monday, April 17, 2023, 02:26:49 PM CDT, *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <legislativehearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
wrote:  

  

  

Mr. Xiong 
Since I did not get a response from you, I am going to schedule this for 5/2 via telephone between 10 and noon.  Please 
provide a phone number for  the hearing.  
 
 
Mai Vang 
Pronouns:  She/Her 
City Council Offices - Legislative Hearings 
15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563 
Legislative Hearing Appeals - www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings 
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-----Original Message----- 
From: xsaota@yahoo.com <xsaota@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 9:51 AM 
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 1019 
 
Good morning 
I was on vacation in November 1 2022 (the whole months) when this Excess bill came to my property , I called 4 time to 
explain my reason why and I did make payments but my payment was return back an now I missed the April 4 hearing . 
My next hearing is May17 at 3pm . Which in that time I work at 2pm already. 
I try everything in my ability to help explains my reasoning off phone called and even paid but my checks got return. 
 
File #J2307E 
 
Parcelid# 33-29-22-21-0017 
 
Saota xiong star 
1019 Beech st  
55106 MN  


