Mai Vang

From: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Sent: Monday, April 17, 2023 7:42 AM
To: ‘Jim McCorkell’

Subject: RE: Assessment

Yes, clearing the snow walk is considered a nuisance abatement which is a property clean up. Again if you are appeal,
please provide a phone number and the whole discussion can take place. The Legislative Hearing Officer can explain the
whole process.

Mai Vang

an

Pronouns: She/Her

City Council Offices — Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals — www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

From: Jim McCorkell <jimbomccorkell@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 4:06 PM

To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Assessment

I’'m still trying to figure this out. If this is an assessment for having the city clear the snow, why don’t you say that
someplace? Everything I've received so far is totally unclear. Are you saying that this 300+ dollar bill was to clear snow at
this property?

Jim McCorkell

On Apr 14, 2023, at 3:30 PM, *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
wrote:

Please provide a phone number for the hearing



Mai Vang

an

Pronouns: She/Her

City Council Offices — Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals — www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings
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From: Jim McCorkell <jimbomccorkell@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 13, 2023 4:28 PM

To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Fwd: Assessment

Please see below. First email bounced back.

Jim McCorkell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Jim McCorkell <JimboMcCorkell@gmail.com>
Subject: Assessment

Date: April 13, 2023 at 3:59:11 PM CDT

To: leqgislativehearings@ci.stpau.mn.us

| received a letter from the city with your email address. | have no idea what this is
about or what it is. It says I'm being assessed $322 for something. It doesn't say what it
is, and | was never alerted to this before now. Can you explain what this is? Why don't
you include an explanation in the original mailing? This is not remotely clear or
understandable communications.

It's for property address 1240 Saint Paul Avenue It says the file number is J2317A and it
is assessment number 238517. The parcel ID is 21-2 8-2 3—2 1-009

Jim McCorkell



