
From: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
To: h.horsch27@gmail.com
Cc: lmoe84@gmail.com; *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Subject: FW: Contesting Assessment
Date: Tuesday, March 21, 2023 9:47:53 AM
Attachments: 1162 Blair Ave.Police report.pdf

1162 Blair Ave.Rest Pro bill.Nov 2022.pdf
1162 Blair Ave.DSI letter..pdf
image001.png

This was laid over to Tuesday, April 4, 2023 via phone between 9:00 and 11:00 am.  Attached are
records related to your appeal to review before the next hearing.
 

Joanna Zimny, J.D.
Legislative Hearing Executive Assistant 
Legislative Hearing Office
Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall
Suite 310
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8585 
joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov 

 
 
 
 

From: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings 
Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 12:15 PM
To: 'lmoe84@gmail.com' <lmoe84@gmail.com>
Cc: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Contesting Assessment
 
Logan Moe,
 
This email is to confirm that your  Legislative Hearing for the Appealed Special Tax Assessment for
property at 1162 BLAIR AVENUE. (File No. J2306B, Assessment No. 238105) has been scheduled for
Tuesday, March 21, 2023 via phone between 9:00 and 11:00 am. Attached are records related to
your appeal.
 
These hearings are conducted by phone, please provide the best phone number to reach you that
morning (and anyone else you wish to have included in that hearing should you wish to do so).
 

Please note that the incoming number from the City shows up as 612-315-7905 so please make
sure to answer.

Thank you,
Joanna

mailto:LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:h.horsch27@gmail.com
mailto:lmoe84@gmail.com
mailto:LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:Sharon.KennedyVickers@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings












































Service Invoice
Date:


11/28/2022


Invoice #


70950


Bill To City of St. Paul
Attn: Steve Magner
375 Jackson St
Saint Paul, MN 55101


Project: 1162 Blair Avenue
Saint Paul


505 Minnehaha Ave W
St. Paul, MN 55103


Requested By


SPPD


P.O.#


22-218-198


Service Date:


11/25/2022


Time:


7:15 PM


Amount Due


Subtotal:


Sales Tax (7.875%)


A service charge of 8% per annum will be charged on all balances 30 days or more past due. All balances 60 days or more past due may be subject to property
liens, collection costs, employee time and expense, other expenses, and attorneys' fees and all other terms outlined in the Restoration Professionals Inc. Service
Agreement.


We accept Mastercard, Visa,
American Express and Discover.


Restoration Professionals
505 Minnehaha Ave W.
Saint Paul, MN 55103


Please make checks payable to:


DescriptionRSN# Quantity Rate Amount


Emergency Board Up 250.00 250.00
Door Secured with Metal Fasteners 1 60.00 60.00


$310.00


$310.00


$0.00








 


 


DE PART M E N T OF SAFE T Y & IN SPE C T ION S (DSI) 
AN G IE  WIE SE ,  PE (M N ), C BO, DIRE C T OR 


 
375 Jackson Street, Suite 220 


Saint Paul, MN 55101-1806 
Tel:  651-266-8989 | Fax: 651-266-9124 


 


C IT Y OF SAIN T PAUL  
M E L VIN C ART ER, M AYOR 


AN AFFIRMATIVE ACTION &  
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER 


ST PAUL .G OV 


 


 
November 30, 2022 
 
 
Hannah E Horsch 
1162 Blair Ave 
St Paul MN 55104-2003 


 
 
 


 
 
 
Dear Sir or Madam: 
 
The City of St. Paul has recently ordered the property at 1162 BLAIR AVE to be 
secured, on Friday November 25, 2022. This work was authorized by the responding 
St. Paul Police Department (case#22-218-198). The cost of this action is $310.00, plus 
City of Saint Paul administration fees of $164.00. 
 
This work was ordered by a city official to abate a nuisance condition which 
comprised an emergency. The Department of Safety and Inspections, Code 
Enforcement Division, can provide more detailed information on this nuisance 
condition upon request. 
 
In several weeks, the registered property owner will receive notice of an assessment 
against the property for $474.00 in charges. At that time, there will be the 
opportunity to pay the assessment to the City of Saint Paul Office of Real Estate 
Assessments or appeal the charges before the Legislative Hearing Office and City 
Council. Note: this assessment CANNOT be paid directly to the Department of Safety 
and Inspections. 
 
The Office of Real Estate Assessments can be reached at 651-266-8858.  If you have 
any other questions, you can contact me at 651-266-1920. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
Joe Yannarelly 
Code Enforcement Inspector 






SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA





 
 

Joanna Zimny
Legislative Hearing Executive Assistant 
Legislative Hearing Office
Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall
Suite 310
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8585 
joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov 

 
 
 
 
-----Original Message-----
From: lmoe84@gmail.com <lmoe84@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, March 6, 2023 8:28 AM
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Contesting Assessment
 
Hello,
 
The address is 1162 Blair Ave, St. Paul, MN 55104
 
Thanks,
Logan Moe
 
> On Mar 6, 2023, at 7:42 AM, *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
wrote:
>
> ﻿Good morning,
>
> We need the property address in order to process your appeal. Due to tomorrow's agenda being
published we will have to push your appeal a couple of weeks as well (which isn't an issue).
>
> Thank you,
> Joanna
>
>
>
> Joanna Zimny
> Legislative Hearing Office
> Pronouns: she/her/hers
> Saint Paul City Hall

mailto:Sharon.KennedyVickers@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings
mailto:lmoe84@gmail.com
mailto:lmoe84@gmail.com
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> Suite 310
> 15 W. Kellogg Blvd.
> Saint Paul, MN 55102
> P: 651-266-8585
> www.StPaul.gov
>
>
>
>
>
> -----Original Message-----
> From: lmoe84@gmail.com <lmoe84@gmail.com>
> Sent: Sunday, March 5, 2023 3:41 PM
> To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
> Subject: Contesting Assessment
>
> Hello,
>
> During the March 7th legislative hearing we would like to contest the assessment # 238105.
>
> Thank You,
> Logan Moe
> 515 419-3068
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