Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, January 3, 2023 9:55 AM

To: Support (Zendesk)

Cc: Haas, Sarah (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 130 Lexington Pkwy N, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104 - (Quarter 3 (July -

September)) - Assessment Inquiry

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Please see WM update.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 3, 2023 9:55 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com>

Subject: RE: 130 Lexington Pkwy N, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

Good Morning,

| checked and looks like we put the check under a holding account as we got no information on
which account the check belonged to. We are now moving the money. Please remove certification.
Thanks

Frances

Franceg €gtrella

Billing Coordinator

11380 Courthouse Blvd

Inver Grove Heights

e festrella@republicservices.com
0 651.286.4588

w RepublicServices.com



R
L P necue:

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 29, 2022 6:10 PM

To: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com>

Subject: FW: 130 Lexington Pkwy N, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

This Message Is From an External Sender e SuEsiEee

This message came from outside your organization.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Clare (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 29, 2022 3:53 PM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Sarah Haas <sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: Re: 130 Lexington Pkwy N, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

Apologies. | forgot to attach the copy of the check.
Best,

Clare Pillsbury

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage

On Thu, December 29 at 15:51, Clare Pillsbury wrote:

2



Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 130 Lexington Pkwy N, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104. Please forward to
Republic Services for their input.

Ticket ID#: 16201

Ticket Requester: Paula Nymeyer

Ticket Requester Email: (if available) paula@wmtitle.com

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16513288085

Property ID #: 022823220207

Property Address: 130 Lexington Pkwy N, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 3 (July - September)

Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2022

Pending Assessment Amount: $132.38

Hauler: Republic Services

Ticket Comments: Paula Nymeyer, title representative at 130 Lexington Pkwy N, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104
contacted the City RE: - Assessment Inquiry. Nymeyer, of Watermark Title, states her firm paid Republic a $173
fee in the beginning of September that they cashed (see attached copy of the check). Now there's an assessment
owed to the City for the same quarter Q3 2022). Please confirm whether the payment was recieved and how it
was applied. Please also provide the following infrmatoin for Q3 - Q4 2022:

- Iltemized breakdown of invoice
- Payment history
- Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage




