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Je #16130 995 3rd St E - Q3 2022 Assessment Inquiry

Submitted Received via Requester
December 27, 2022 at 14:22 Mail Adan Molina
CCs

Sarah Haas <sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Status Priority Group Assignee
Open Normal PW - Garbage Clare Pillsbury

Assessment No. Property ID Number Latitude/Longitude

220115 332922240190 -93.05848,44.95685

Location Other Name Garbage Hauler

995 3rd St E, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 Adan Molina  Aspen Waste Systems

Have you contacted your hauler about this garbage bill before?

No

Staff Comments Billing year for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
Staff recommends removing the assessment. 2022

Date of CP (MM/DD/YYYY) Total amount due for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
3/8/2023 122.81

Legislative Hearing Required Date of LH (MM/DD/YYYY)

Yes 1/5/2023

Stated Reason for Appeal (if given)

Hauler requested that the assessment be removed. They stated that the unpaid balance was sent to the city in
error.

Did you receive a Saint Paul City Council Public Hearing Notice Ratification of Assessment?
Yes

Garbage Invoice Dates (i.e. January 1- March 31)

July 1 - September 30

Billing period for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment Time of LH

Quarter 3 (July - September) 11:00 AM

Clare Pillsbury December 27, 2022 at 14:22

Will do! Thanks for letting me know. | assume that | don’t have to contact the property owner back then. | will
just send a letter once its done.

Clare Pillsbury
A Management Assistant | - Citywide Garbage Program

Pronouns: she/her/hers
AAAA

Department of Public Works
800 City Hall Annex

25 West Fourth St
SAI N T PAU L Saint Paul, MN 55102
MINNESOTA P: 651-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www. StPaul.gov
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From: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2022 2:10 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 995 3rd St E

Can you follow up and get this removed? Not sure if | missed it or Greg....

Sarah Haas

Garbage Program Manager
She/Her/Hers

Public Works

25 4 st. West, Floor 800
Saint Paul, MN 55102
P:651-266-6216
sarah.haas@stpaul.gov
www.StPaul.gov

Y SAINT PAUL
Ll MINNESOTA

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2022 2:04 PM

To: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 995 3rd St E

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Sarah,
| think I sent this but | didn’t file like a normally do? Just checking.

Greg Revering

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.
grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Stacey Sanders <ssanders@aspenwaste.com>
Sent: Monday, December 26, 2022 10:32 AM

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: 995 3rd St E

Morning Greg

Please see email below that | send back in October. This address was assessed for Q3 in error
for which | sent this email below about but the customer called on Friday stating they were still receiving
notifications from the City about it.

Please advise

Stacey Sanders
Aspen Waste Systems
Office Operations Manager
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612-884-8017
ssanders@aspenwaste.com

From: Stacey Sanders

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2022 11:38 AM
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: 995 3rd St E

Good Morning Greg
In our last submission to the City for past due accounts a balance of $122.81 was sent in error for the
address above. Can you please update them on this and we of course have updated our records as well

Thank you

Stacey Sanders

Aspen Waste Systems
Office Operations Manager
612-884-8017
ssanders@aspenwaste.com
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