Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, January 9, 2023 3:32 PM

To: Samuel Brown

Subject: RE: FW: Graffiti Abatement Consent for 501 West Lynnhurst Avenue, Saint Paul MN
55104

Hello Mr. Brown,
Sorry for delaying my response. | found the waiver so the fee will be recommended for deletion.

Thank you.

Mai Vamg

Pronouns: She/Her

City Council Offices - Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals - www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

From: Samuel Brown <samuelchapinbrown@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 3, 2023 10:09 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_DSI-InformationAndComplaints <DSI-InformationAndComplaints@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
<LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: Re: FW: Graffiti Abatement Consent for 501 West Lynnhurst Avenue, Saint Paul MN 55104

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Hello

| am following up on this to make sure this was removed from the legislative hearing scheduled for today. Please confirm
this has been completed or updated.

Thanks

SAM



On Tue, Dec 20, 2022 at 12:14 PM *CI-StPaul_DSI-InformationAndComplaints <DSI-
InformationAndComplaints@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Good Afternoon Mai,

Would you be able to assist in this matter? It appears a waiver is on file from 3/17/22 for 501 Lynnhurst Ave W.

Thank you,

Ashli J.

She/Her

Interim Communications Team Manager

SAINT PAUL  Department of Safety and Inspections
MINNESOTA 375 Jackson St

Suite 220
Saint Paul, MN 55101

P: 651.266.8989
Dsi-informationandcomplaints@ci.stpaul.mn.us

From: Samuel Brown <samuelchapinbrown@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 19, 2022 10:58 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_DSI-InformationAndComplaints <DSI-InformationAndComplaints@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Graffiti Abatement Consent for 501 West Lynnhurst Avenue, Saint Paul MN 55104

Hi Kelly



The graffiti on our building was painted over sometime in the late summer or early fall. However, | just received a
notification of a charge

assessment for $263.84 for removal. This should not be the case since.

The FILE # is J2302P and the Assessment # is: 238401

This is for Brown & Brown Investments

501 W Lynnhurst Ave, St Paul, MN 55104

Can you please address this and let me know what we were charged and what this is for?

Thanks for helping clear this up.

SAM

On Thu, Mar 17, 2022 at 10:47 AM *CI-StPaul_DSI-InformationAndComplaints <DSI-
InformationAndComplaints@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Thank you!

This has been saved to your file.



SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

Kelly

(She/Her)

Department of Safety & Inspections
375 Jackson St, #220

Saint Paul, MN 55101

P: 651-266-8989

From: Samuel Brown <samuelchapinbrown@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2022 10:43 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_DSI-InformationAndComplaints <DSI-InformationAndComplaints@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Graffiti Abatement Consent for 501 West Lynnhurst Avenue, Saint Paul MN 55104

Hi Kelly

This is in reference to the call we just had. Thanks for your help with this.

Attached is the Graffiti abatement form signed.

| should note that we have graffiti on two sides of our building (north along the alley and west along the side).



We also have a large graffiti on an upper portion above the roof of the first floor. It is along the north side of the upper
part of the building.

Thanks -SAM

612-501-6586



