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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2022 1:11 PM
To: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 287 Atwater St

Thanks! I believe that Mai would enter the file for that. Let me know if I need to do anything. Also, I updated the subject 
to reflect that the address of the property is 287 Atwater St. I had accidentally included the wrong address (279 Atwater) 
I made so I wanted to make sure there was no confusion  সহ঺঻ 
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I - Citywide Garbage Program
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
 
Department of Public Works  
800 City Hall Annex 
25 West Fourth St 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 

   
   
 
 

From: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) <Lindsay.Butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2022 8:06 AM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 279 Atwater St 
 
Good morning, I learned yesterday that a new file for the Q2 I removed per the previous emails would need to be 
entered to replace the Q1 TA that’s in legistar and a new AR is needed.  Thank you 
 
 
 
Lindsay Butterfield 
Office of Financial Services - Assessments 
700 City Hall 
15 West Kellogg Boulevard 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
Lindsay.butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
651-266-6343 
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From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, December 9, 2022 12:44 PM 
To: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) <Lindsay.Butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) 
<mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 279 Atwater St 
 
Thanks for clarifying Lindsay! We just need to remove Q2 2022.  
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I - Citywide Garbage Program
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
 
Department of Public Works  
800 City Hall Annex 
25 West Fourth St 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 

   
   
 
 

From: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) <Lindsay.Butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, December 9, 2022 10:09 AM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, 
Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 279 Atwater St 
 
Good morning, I was looking over 287 Atwater st again before Lynn removed it from certification and I’m a little 
confused, all of the emails are saying to remove Q2 which was done on 11/23 but the resolution in legistar is saying that 
Q1 should have been removed? I was just hoping to clarify if Q1 should be removed from certification or if Q2 was the 
only quarter to be removed?  
Thank you 
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Lindsay Butterfield 
Office of Financial Services - Assessments 
700 City Hall 
15 West Kellogg Boulevard 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
Lindsay.butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
651-266-6343 
 
 

 
 
 
 

From: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 1:52 PM 
To: 'Support (Zendesk)'; Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) 
<tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 279 Atwater St 
 
Deletion complete 
 
 
 
Lindsay Butterfield 
Office of Financial Services - Assessments 
700 City Hall 
15 West Kellogg Boulevard 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
Lindsay.butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
651-266-6343 
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From: Clare (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 1:08 PM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; 
Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) <Lindsay.Butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 279 Atwater St 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Shoot! The property ID is 252923420197 so the address should be 287 Atwater St.  

 

Thanks! 

 

Clare Pillsbury 

 

--  

Clare Pillsbury 

City of Saint Paul 

Department of Public Works - Garbage 

651-266-6101 

garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  605f6929- 6aa7-11ed-80a6- 9357cd7f4420 29eacecf-6b62- 11ed-b65f-da9de23c810c 03c10c1On Tue, November 22 at 15:04, Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) wrote:  

Hello! I don’t see any delinquent trash charges for any quarter for 279 Atwater st, do I have the correct address? 

  

  

  

Lindsay Butterfield 

Office of Financial Services - Assessments 



5

700 City Hall 

15 West Kellogg Boulevard 

Saint Paul, MN 55102 

Lindsay.butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

651-266-6343 

  

  

 

  

  

  

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 22, 2022 2:59 PM 

To: Butterfield, Lindsay (CI-StPaul) <Lindsay.Butterfield@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) 

<tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

Subject: FW: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 279 Atwater St 

  

See Claire now below.   

  

Mai Vang 

Pronouns:  She/Her 

City Council Offices – Legislative Hearings 
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15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall 

Saint Paul, MN 55102 

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563 

Legislative Hearing Appeals – www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings 

 

  

  

From: Clare (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 22, 2022 2:51 PM 

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

Subject: Please Remove Q2 2022 Assessment for 279 Atwater St 

  

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

  

Hello Mai, 

  

Is it still possible to get a file in to remove the Q2 2022 assessment for 279 Atwater St? It looks like there were two 

accounts set up for the property and the property owner was being double billed. Since they paid one account, we 

are requesting that the Q2 2022 assessment be removed. If possible, please let me know by tomorrow if you are 

able to remove it. 

  

Thanks! Happy Thanksgiving! 

  

--  

Clare Pillsbury 

City of Saint Paul 

Department of Public Works - Garbage 
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651-266-6101 

garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  605f6929- 6aa7-11ed-80a6- 9357cd7f4420 605f6929-6aa7- 11ed-80a6-9357cd7f4420 03c10c1  


