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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com
Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2022 7:41 AM
To: Support (Zendesk)
Cc: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: Delinquents

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Please see update from Gene’s Disposal. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Gene's Disposal <genesdisposal@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2022 4:46 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: Delinquents 
 
See below emails- I requested the $4.66 be removed from 690 Hoyt Ave E on July 7th 
 
Thanks, 
Beth 
Gene's Disposal Service, Inc 
651-426-1224, Mon - Fri, 8 am - 4:30 pm 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Sent: Thursday, July 7, 2022 3:16 PM 
To: Gene's Disposal 
Cc: Gene W; Lisa Wegleitner 
Subject: FW: Delinquents 
 
FYI 
  
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
  
763-295-2054 
  

From: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 7, 2022 2:44 PM 
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To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Delinquents 
  
Yep! 
  
Sarah Haas  
Garbage Program Manager 
She/Her/Hers 
Public Works 
25 4th St. West, Floor 800 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P:651-266-6216  
sarah.haas@stpaul.gov 
www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

  
From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 7, 2022 2:10 PM 
To: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: Delinquents 
  

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

  
Sarah, 
Please see request from Gene’s Disposal. 
  
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
  
763-295-2054 
  

From: Gene's Disposal <genesdisposal@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 7, 2022 1:16 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: Delinquents 
  
Can this one be removed: 
  
690 Hoyt Ave E Ryan R McFarren $4.66 
  
  
Thanks, 
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Beth 
Gene's Disposal Service, Inc 
651-426-1224, Mon - Fri, 8 am - 4:30 pm 
  

From: Gene's Disposal 
Sent: Wednesday, July 6, 2022 11:15 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Gene W; Lisa Wegleitner 
Subject: Delinquents 
  
Hey Greg-  
I think this is everything for the non payers. 
  
Thanks, 
Beth 
Gene's Disposal Service, Inc 
651-426-1224, Mon - Fri, 8 am - 4:30 pm 
  
  
 


