Naylor, Racquel (Cl-StPaul)

From: Naylor, Racquel (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, May 5, 2022 9:54 AM

To: WinstonTuanNguyen@yahoo.com

Cc: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings

Subject: Corrected time - 850 University Avenue West, J2223A
Mr. Nguyen,

| just left you a voice mail at 713-628-1362.

The time below should be 10:00 a.m. My apologie; for the inconvenience.
| am working on getting a Vietnamese interpreter for Ms. Bui.

Again, we will see you in the hearing room at 10:00 a.m.

Have a good day.

-Racquel

From: Naylor, Racquel (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, May 4, 2022 11:25 AM

To: WinstonTuanNguyen@yahoo.com

Cc: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul. mn.us>
Subject: 850 University Avenue West, J2223A

Winston Tuan Nguyen,

Per our conversation, your Legislative Hearing is scheduled for Tuesday, May 17, 2022, 10:00 8:88 a.m. The hearing
location is Room 330 City Hall, 15 Kellogg Boulevard West, Saint Paul, MN 55102. You and Dianna Bui will be attending
this hearing. You said that you do not want to have a hearing over the phone.

Per your request, | will schedule a Vietnamese interpreter to be at this hearing for Ms. Bui.
Thank you.

Racquel Naylor

Legislative Hearings

Suite 310 City Hall

15 Kellogg Boulevard West
Saint Paul, MN 55102
Phone: 651-266-8585

Fax: 651-266-8574



Naxlor, Racquel (CI-StPaul)

From: Naylor, Racquel (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, May 4, 2022 11:25 AM
To: WinstonTuanNguyen@yahoo.com
Cc: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Subject: 850 University Avenue West, J2223A

Winston Tuan Nguyen,

Per our conversation, your Legislative Hearing is scheduled for Tuesday, May 17, 2022, 9:00 a.m. The hearing location is
Room 330 City Hall, 15 Kellogg Boulevard West, Saint Paul, MN 55102. You and Dianna Bui will be attending this
hearing. You said that you do not want to have a hearing over the phone.

Per your request, | will schedule a Vietnamese interpreter to be at this hearing for Ms. Bui.
Thank you.

Racquel Naylor

Legislative Hearings

Suite 310 City Hall

15 Kellogg Boulevard West
Saint Paul, MN 55102
Phone: 651-266-8585

Fax: 651-266-8574



Naylor, Racquel (Cl-StPaul)

From: winstontuannguyen nguyen <winstontuannguyen@yahoo.coms
Sent: Tuesday, May 3, 2022 3.21 PM

To: *C|-StPaul_Contact-Council

Subject: Clear up misunderstanding of snow clearing

Attachments: Image 1.jpg; Image 2,jpg; Image 3.jpg

850 University Avenue W.
Saint Paul, MN 55104
Dianna Dong Thi Bui

Parcel ID# 35-29-23-42-0013

file # J2223A Assessment # 228525

Dear Sir Madam,

t have received your notice of cleaning the snow on my house which | had already done. After |
received this notice, | called the city of Saint Paul officer who was on the notice to notify him that | had
already shoveled the snow on the sidewalk. He did call back but unfortunately at that time, | was
unable t answer the call due to a change of phone number. | did try and give him a call back several
times but was unable to reach the officer. | later received a bill of $322 from the city of Saint Paul
since they want to bill me for the supposed labor that had been done. | am having a hard time
understanding why | must pay for work that | had done myself. | myself am a senior and do not make
a lot. | have worked for the city of Saint Paul for more than 20 years. Due to this, it has caused me
frustration and | hope you can understand why. | have a hearing for this on June 22™ of 2022. | took
pictures at that time to document the proof of the clearing of the snow on the sidewalks. | have lived
at this property and have always maintained it clean. | am hoping to reach an understanding and see
what can be done about this charge. The best way to reach me is by phone number and mail. My
phone number is 713-628-1362. Thank you for your time and | hope to hear from you soon,

From,

Dianna Dong Thi Bui
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