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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com
Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 3:32 PM
To: Support (Zendesk)
Cc: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: FW: 325 Topping St, Saint Paul, MN, 55117, USA - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - 

Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Please see update from Advanced. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>  
Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 2:21 PM 
To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com> 
Cc: Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: 325 Topping St, Saint Paul, MN, 55117, USA - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry 
 
The payment on 10/14/21 paid for Q4 $101.20. Q3$101.20 plus $15.18 in late fees was tax rolled 10/4/21.  
 
Thank you 
 
Kim Shannon | Operations Specialist/Scale Operator 
 

 
309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN  55103 
T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552  | E: kshannon@wm.com 
Connect with us:     AdvancedDisposal.com     Facebook      YouTube 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 12:56 PM 
To: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com> 
Cc: Koupal, Matthew <mkoupal@wm.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 325 Topping St, Saint Paul, MN, 55117, USA - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment 
Inquiry 
 
Kim, 
Please see the information and request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 



2

St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Sarah (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>  
Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 10:21 AM 
To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: 325 Topping St, Saint Paul, MN, 55117, USA - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry 
 
Hello, 

 

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 325 Topping St, Saint Paul, MN, 55117, USA. Please forward to 

Advanced Disposal for their input.  

 

Ticket ID#: 1877 

Ticket Requester: Mike Evans 

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)  

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) 16519836836 

Property ID #: 252923420174 

Property Address: 325 Topping St, Saint Paul, MN, 55117, USA 

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 3 (July - September) 

Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2021 

Pending Assessment Amount: $116.38 

Hauler: Advanced Disposal 

Ticket Comments:  

 

The resident states they already paid the bill. Please provide the city with the billing and payment history for Q3 and 

Q4 for this property.  

 

 

 

Thank you, 

 

Clare Pillsbury 

 

----- 

City of Saint Paul 

Department of Public Works - Garbage 

651-266-6101 

garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 

 

-- 
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Sarah Haas 

City of Saint Paul 

Department of Public Works - Garbage 

651-266-6101 

garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage 
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