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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Kedrowski, Richard (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Wednesday, December 8, 2021 8:43 AM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Martin, Lisa (CI-StPaul); Warner, Otis (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 1050 Oxford St N - Assessment

J2204E is correct. Only one was being dismissed. 
 

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 8, 2021 8:38 AM 
To: Kedrowski, Richard (CI-StPaul) <Richard.Kedrowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Martin, Lisa (CI-StPaul) <lisa.martin@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Warner, Otis (CI-StPaul) <Otis.Warner@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1050 Oxford St N - Assessment 
 
If it has gone to assessment, I can prepare a resolution to delete one.  I am assuming it’s J2204E. 
 

 
Mai Vang 
City Council Offices – Legislative Hearings 
15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563 
Legislative Hearing Appeals – www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings 

 

 
 

From: Kedrowski, Richard (CI-StPaul) <Richard.Kedrowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 8, 2021 8:35 AM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Martin, Lisa (CI-StPaul) <lisa.martin@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Warner, Otis (CI-StPaul) <Otis.Warner@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 1050 Oxford St N - Assessment 
 
Good morning Mai, 
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I have an Excessive Consumption Fee that went to Assessment on this property. There were actually two Fees, but 
Inspector Otis Warner had agreed to dismiss the second fee: Bill #1581968, Payment #1487516 on 9/1/21. Inspector 
Warner forgot to delete the Fee and now it has gone to Assessment.  
 
The Property Owner, Thomas McDonough, called Inspector Warner after receiving the Assessment letter and asked how 
we can correct the situation. Is it possible to delete the Assessment without filing an Appeal? 
 
Please let me know how to advise the Property Owner to make this right. 
 
Thanks, 
Dick 

 

Richard Kedrowski 
Supervisor 
DSI Inspector III 
Department of Safety & Inspections 
375 Jackson Street, Suite 220 
Saint Paul, MN 55101 
P: 651-266-9141 Fax: 651-266-1919 
richard.kedrowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 
 

 
 


